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ABSTRACT

Sternocleidomastoid is an important muscle of head and neck lying in close 
proximity to the vital structures like spinal accessory nerve, external jugular 
vein, carotid sheath with its contents, greater auricular nerve, facial and 

lingual veins, cervical plexus, vagus nerve, ansa cervicalis etc. It originates as 
two heads, one from the superolateral part of manubrium sterni in form of a 
tendon (sternal head) and another from  medial one-third of superior surface 
of clavicle which is a musculotendinous structure (Clavicular head). The 
muscle is inserted into lateral aspect of mastoid process with the help of thick 
tendon and into lateral half of superior nuchal line by a thin aponeurosis.
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INTRODUCTION

Sternocleidomastoid is an important muscle of head and neck lying in 
close proximity to the vital structures like spinal accessory nerve, external 

jugular vein, carotid sheath with its contents, greater auricular nerve, facial 
and lingual veins, cervical plexus, vagus nerve, ansa cervicalis etc. It originates 
as two heads, one from the superolateral part of manubrium sterni in form of 
a tendon (sternal head) and another from medial one-third of superior surface 
of clavicle which is a musculotendinous structure (Clavicular head). The 
muscle is inserted into lateral aspect of mastoid process with the help of thick 
tendon and into lateral half of superior nuchal line by a thin aponeurosis. We 
report a series of 3 cases where variations were noted along both origin and 
insertion of SCM muscle [1].

CASE REPORT

During a neck dissection of a 49-year-old male patient who was a case of 
well differentiated squamous cell carcinoma of left buccal mucosa in the 
Department of Oral and Maxillofacial surgery, A.C.P.M Dental College and 
Hospital, Dhule, a rare variation was found towards the end of insertion of 
SCM muscle. Skin, superficial fascia, platysma, deep fascia was removed and 
the muscles of neck were exposed [2]. The variation that was encountered was 
an unusual split towards the insertion end of SCM just above the point where 
lesser occipital nerve communicates with greater auricular nerve. Normally, 
the muscle along its insertion is a continuous band which gets inserted into 
lateral aspect of mastoid process and the occipital bone. This unusual split 
gave rise to a triangular space superiorly and two bellies which are assumed to 
be inserted into mastoid and occipital bone separately. The exact attachments 
were not exposed as it was not the need of the operative procedure. Also, it 
can always be suspected that the same variation could be bilateral [3].

The boundaries of the so formed triangle can be marked as it is bounded 

anteroinferior by carotid triangle and its contents, superiorly by the mastoid 
process and part of occipital bone and posteroinferiorly by occipital part 
of posterior triangle of neck. Superficially, this space is related to skin, 
superficial fascia,platysma, external jugular vein, part of posterior division of 
retromandibular and posterior auricular veins, some part of lesser occipital 
nerve. Deep relations include superior part of carotid sheath along with its 
contents, posterior belly of digastric, internal jugular vein [4].

All the variations of SCM can be attributed to the unusual splitting in the 
mesoderm of the posterior sixth branchial arch during organogenesis. It is 
however also possible that such variations are evolutionary in nature. In most 
cases, these variations go unnoticed and do not produce any symptoms. But 
this may cause functional deficits as the muscle lies in close proximity to 
various neurovascular structures. SCM has many vital structures under its 
andthus provides physical protection to them. Thus, all these variations may 
or may not just compromise this protective function which is more relevant 
in this case.

CASE REPORT (2)

During a routine neck dissection of a 55 year old male patient who was a 
diagnosed case of Well Differentiated Squamous Cell Carcinoma of right 
lower gingivobuccal sulcus in the Department of Oral and Maxillofacial 
Surgery, A.C.P.M Dental College and Hospital, Dhule, a variation in the 
anatomy of SCM that was encountered was an additional clavicular head 
which originated from superior surface of middle third of clavicle as a fresh 
belly and blended with the fibres of normal clavicular head of the muscle. 
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Figure 1) Retromandibular and posterior auricular veins.

 

Figure 2) Squamous Cell Carcinoma of right lower gingivobuccal sulcus.
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The size of the extra clavicular head was almost the half of normal clavicular 
head [5].

The presence of additional heads of SCM have previously been reported 
unilaterally as well as bilaterally. Some have also reported separate cleido-
occipital muscle. The presence of additional bellies bilaterally has been 
reported by Nayak et al. (2006) and Ramesh et al. (2007). The knowledge of 
variations of sternocleidomastoid

muscle is important for head and neck surgeons. It is also useful for the 
plastic surgeons. The sternocleidomastoid muscle can be used in several ways 
during surgery. Conley & Gullane (1980) have explained various uses of the 
muscle such as a). its use along with a part of clavicle to reconstruct mandible, 
b). reconstruct mandibular defects, c). transportas a myocutaneous flap for 
reconstruction to protect carotid and innominate arteries.

The additional head reported by us may not have any functional advantage 
on the movement of the neck. Since it covers the movement of the neck. 
Since it covers the lower part of the neck, it might cause difficulties in the 
surgeries in that region. It may also interfere in invasive techniques. Plastic 
surgeons can make best use of this Plastic surgeons can make best use of 
this [6].

CASE REPORT (3)

During a routine neck dissection of a 39 year old male who was a diagnosed 
case of well differentiated squamous cell carcinoma of left buccal mucosa, 
left lower lip, alveolus, in the Department of Oral and Maxillofacial Surgery, 
A.C.P.M Dental College, Dhule, a rare variation was encountered in the 
anatomy of Sternocleidomastoid of right side as there was no division of the 
muscle towards its end of origin into separate sternal and clavicular heads 
which is a normal feature of the muscle. Such a division normally produces a 
lesser supraclavicular fossa housing important neurovascular structures like 
lower part of Internal Jugular Vein and Subclavian vein.

The absence of such a split would result in complete obliteration of the 
lesser supraclavicular fossa thereby altering the normal anatomy of the same. 
The major neurovascular structures present beneath may be positioned 
abnormally at least expected sites. Now such a phenomenon will significantly 
cause trouble in routine procedures like I.J.V cannulation where lesser 
supraclavicular fossa is taken as a guide to perform the procedure. Also, 
surgeons may accidently encounter such a variation in anatomy which 
maylead to great difficulties during the procedure in identification and 
isolation of major neurovascular structures.
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Figure 3) Identification and isolation of major neurovascular structures.


