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EDITORIAL 

Psychiatry is the medical science dedicated to the diagnosis, 
prevention and treatment of mental disorders. These embody 
various maladaptation associated with mood, behavior, cognition, 
and perceptions. See glossary of psychiatry. The combined 
treatment of psychological medication and psychotherapy has 
become the foremost common psychiatrically treatment in current 
practice. Treatment can be delivered on an inpatient or outpatient 
basis, depending on the severity of functional impairment or on 
other aspects of the disorder in question. 

Emotional wellness is not recently the nonattendance of 
psychological issue. It is characterized as a condition of prosperity 
in which everyone understands his or her own potential, can adapt 
to the typical worries of life, can work gainfully and productively, 
and can make a commitment to her or his group. It impacts every 
single one of us. We have emotional well-being, similarly as we have 
physical wellbeing. Individuals living with an emotional well-being 
issue or condition can encounter positive psychological well-being, 
and an individual may encounter poor emotional wellness without 
a psychological wellness condition. Emotional wellness is not 
settled. 

 

Mental health includes psychological, emotional, and social well-
being. Mental Health Nursing is the role of nurses to take care of 
individuals belonging to all ages with psychological state or mental 
distress like dementia praecox, manic depressive illness, psychosis, 
depression or dementia, bipolar disorder, etc... These licensed 
registered nurses work with communities, groups, families, and 
individuals assessing their mental health needs.
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